
 
Iris Arc Wins Best Service Provider Solution in First Annual Relativity Fest 

Innovation Awards 
Award honors Iris Data Services for building a unique managed services option in Relativity 

 
Kansas City, November 3, 2014 – Iris Data Services, the leader in eDiscovery managed services, today 
announced that they have been awarded the Relativity Fest Innovation Award for Best Service Provider 
Solution for their Arc product. Arc was recognized for taking advantage of Relativity as a platform by 
providing their clients with a dedicated environment and administrative control within Iris’ instance of 
Relativity.  
 
Judges selected Arc because it uses various integration points to develop a cost-effective eDiscovery 
workflow, displays a full use of the API’s capability to streamline processes, solves complex workflow 
needs, and creates an altogether new solution. 
 
“We’re thrilled that kCura has recognized how unique Arc is with this award,” said Major Baisden, Iris’ 
Co-Founder and President.  “Relativity’s flexibility as a platform has allowed Iris to create an incredible 
degree of alignment with our clients. Arc is the perfect complement to Relativity.” 
 
“The reaction to Arc has been amazing,” said Damon Goduto, Iris’ Co-Founder and Senior Vice President 
of Sales.  “Arc has exceeded all of our expectations and clearly filled a large gap in the eDiscovery 
marketplace.” 
 
“It’s awesome to see long-time partners like Iris Data Services continuing to innovate with the platform,” 
said Andrew Sieja, President and CEO of kCura. “We’re excited to honor them with this recognition.” 
 
In addition to Iris, kCura also recognized the law firm Troutman Sanders during a special ceremony at 
Relativity Fest. The annual user conference brought more than 1,000 users together for a three-day 
event featuring engaging panel discussions, hands-on labs, breakout sessions, and insights from both 
kCura staff and Relativity end users—all designed to provide a great Relativity educational experience.  
 
About Iris 
Iris Data Services is the leader in eDiscovery managed services. Iris’ suite of products includes Horizon, a 
processing workflow that seamlessly integrates best-in-class applications, and Arc, a private Relativity 
environment for a fixed monthly fee. Iris’ U.S. headquarters is in Kansas City and its European 
headquarters is in London. Iris also maintains offices throughout the United States, Europe, India, and 
China.  For more information about Iris, visit www.irisds.com.  

 
About kCura 
Recognized as a “Leader” in Gartner’s 2014 E-Discovery Magic Quadrant, kCura are the developers of 
the e-discovery software Relativity. Relativity has more than 100,000 active users worldwide from 
organizations including the U.S. Department of Justice and all of the AM Law 100. kCura helps 
corporations, law firms, and government agencies meet e-discovery challenges by installing Relativity 
on-premises and providing hosted, on-demand solutions through a global network of partners. kCura 
has been ranked the 100th fastest-growing technology company in North America on Deloitte's 

http://www.troutmansanders.com/troutman-sanders-wins-relativity-fest-innovation-award-for-best-law-firm-solution-10-20-2014/
http://www.irisds.com/
http://www.irisds.com/iris-horizon/
http://www.irisds.com/iris-arc/
http://kcura.com/relativity/gartner-2014-magic-quadrant-for-e-discovery
http://www.deloitte.com/assets/Dcom-UnitedStates/Local%20Assets/Documents/TMT_us_tmt/us_tmt_fast500_rankings_110713.pdf


Technology Fast 500 and named one of Chicago's Top Workplaces by the Chicago Tribune. Please 
contact kCura at sales@kcura.com or visit www.kcura.com for more information. 
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